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Measurement Sheet
|{Company Name Dr NRK Biotech pvt Itd
Project Name Nextopolis Approved By C BALAMURALIKRISHNA
‘Work Description DLC excavation work Sign
|Contractor Name John earthwork
|Prepared By G Rahu
[Date 2022-09-06
| A B C D E=AxBXCXOD
| _SNo Item Head Iten Description Length _ Breadth _ Height  No's ~ Quantity  Units  Total Quantty,
16 excavation workDLC work
Center part 156 27 16520 100 100 25816 21
| eastern part 4269 8150 1.00 100 3478 90
{ 4269 7527 100 050 1606 40
wstern part M2 11129 1.00 1.00 4586 .25
4121 4234 100 050 87243

36360 19




[Measurement
Company Name
Project Name
Work Description
[Contractor Name
[Prepared By

Date

| 5 N Item Head

Dr NRK Biotech pvt Itd

Neoxtopolis
DL C axcavation work

John earthwork
G Rahul
20220906

Item Deoscription Quantity

36360 19

16" excavation woiDLC work

Apy roved By
Sign

Units Rate

sft 0

Note AS per anand sir instructions and approved rate  Approval sheet is enclosed

Inwords:seventy five thousand only

. BALAMURAL IKRISHNA

Porcantage

100%

Total amount

75000/



B of Consumahles Allowance

C 1 john
Yapral

Hyderabad - SO00%7

Date 09-¢
'" favor of: \Q"o'"‘“q
Project / Site: DR NRK BIOTFCHPVTLTD
Location: Thurkapeth
Type of Work: earthwork
Towards: \llowance for ( onsumables
. Amount

S.\o Description

Bref Description of work done: Towards Completion of

excavation work Rs. 15000 -

T'otal Amount — 75000/-

ate 15-02-2022
Work Done from date: 01-01-2022 to date 15-02-2

Amount in words' Rs. Fifteen thousand only

Sign



Bl of Consumables Allowance

CH john

Yapral

Hyderabad - 500087

Date 09-6-207

In favor of:

Nextopolis
Project / Site: DRNRK BIOTECHPVT LTD
Location: hurkapelly
Type of Waork: earthwork
Towards: \llowance for Consumables

¢ Amount
S No. Description
| Brief Description of work done Towards Completion of

excavation work Rs. 15000 -
Total Amount  75000/-

. . 15-.02-2022
Work Done from date 01-01-2022 to date 15-02-202.

Amount in words Rs Fifteen thousand only



Bill of equipment

\Nowance

CJoe
\-I[N:ﬂ
Hyvderabad - son08

Jat 1.l
In favor of: Nextopolis
Project ' Nite: DRNRK BIOTECHPVTITD
L ocation: Thurkapelh
Type of Work: earthwork
Towards: \llowance for equipment
o t
S \a Description A\moun
Brief Description of work done Towards Completion of
excavation work Rs 30000

Total Amount - 75000, -

> 20199
Work Done from date 01-01-2022 to date 15-02-20.22

Amount i words Rs Thirty thousand only

Sign




subject  Re:Reagarding plinth excavation work for DLC work

To: [rahul g <rahul g@modiproperties.com>]

From anand kumar bhashyakarla <anandhomeline@gmail.com>

Cc: [balamuralikrishna.c . <balamuralikrishna.c@modiproperties.com>]

Date Thu, Apr 21,2022 at 6:41 PM

Approved.

On Thu, 21 Apr 2022 at 4:48 PM, rahul g <rahul.g@modipro > wrote:

Dear Anand sir,

As per your instructions and discussion held at site, we have fixed 7.5000/- Iumpsum. for
excavation work of 6" in plinth beam for John(earthwork). Please give us approval sir.

Regards,
G.Rahul
Nrk

Sent from Gmail Mobile
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