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Fw: Regarding ms structure staircase rates finalization.

From: Subba Reddy (subbareddy@modiproperties.com)

To:

rameshreddy@modiproperties.com; prabhakar@modiproperties.com; anwar@modiproperties.com;
waseem@modiproperties.com

Date: Friday, March 31, 2023 at 11:04 AM GMT+5:30

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

————— Forwarded message -----

From: "subbareddy@modiproperties.com" <subbareddy@modiproperties.com>

To: "sohammodi@modiproperties.com" <sohammodi@maodiproperties.com>, "sachin_modiproperties.com"
<sachin@modiproperties.com>

Cc:

Sent: Wed, 29 Mar 2023 at 17:27

Subject: Regarding ms structure staircase rates finalization.

Respected Soham sir,

As per your instructions given on yesterday, Anwar sapose to come to gvdc for negotiation of ms staircase. |
called at around 11: 30 am , he said i am on driving going to gmr once i reach gmr i call you. He is not call me up
to 5: 00 pm. Just now i called him he said i came from gmr to ho as per md sir instructions.

| asked wnen will you comming to gvdc , he said i will come on day after tomorrow .

This is for your information sir.

| negotiated with Khaleel ( SA Structure).
He agreed to work at the rate of rs.100/- + GST Per kg. Including material, consumables, tools, transportation,
lifting and errection All includes .

Payment will be made as per material received quantity (with our GV kanta. )
Work will be completed in 30 days after gettingthe po .

Please advise me sir.
Thank you sir,
Regards,
Subbareddy.

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android
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