Anx C - Guideline Rates Approval Form

Form SI. No. | 1063 | Scan 1d | Date | 13.06.2024
Sl. No. Description of work Additional specs/remarks Units Rate Rate ID
1. 2" level tie beam,columns concreting M3 800/-
: 2™ level tie beam-Lift & lead of Rft 50/-
materials
3.
4.
3.
6.
7.
8.
9.
10.
Circular /IM no. N/A Projects applicable NRK-Sravan Validity Specific Work
contractor
Rate includes GST? | Excl. GST GST bill required? Not required Work type Labour only
Remarks:
Approved by project manager Approved by QS team Approved by Director
Sign:N .Ramkishan Sign: /) q'\{%( 1 Sign: A
Date:13.06.2024 Date:w&@ ¥f olo W L_—" Date: I -

Notes: 1.8ite/QS to fill in the word copy of the form. 2. Engineers/purchase to send this form to gs@modipfGperties.in. 3. QS to review /correct and send fopKIDs appros®iN. Wcluding those that need
updation/correction/clarification in circulars and internal memos must be approved via this form.3. Enter details for clarity to ensure that there is no ambiguily pe
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Anx C - Guideline Rates Approval Form

Form Sl. No. | | Scan Id ] | Date ~| 13.06.2024
SI. No. | Description of work Additional specs/remarks Units ary Rate ID

1. | 2" Jevel tie beam,columns concreting M3 (1830 , .lal —

2. 2" Jevel tie beam-Lift & lead of Rft o DY\

materials el

3

4.

S

6.

7.

8.

9.

10.
Circular /IM no. N/A Projects applicable NRK-Sravan Validity Specific Work

contractor

Rate includes GST? | Excl. GST GST bill required? Not required Work type Labour only
Remarks: P
Approved by project manager Approved by QS team Approved by Director [
Sign:N .Ramkishan Sign: Sign: _— N
Date:13.06.2024 Date: Date:

Notes: 1.Site/QS to fill in the word copy of the form. 2. Engineers/purchase to send this form to qs@modiproperties.in. 3. QS to review /correct and send for MDs

updation/correction/clarification in circulars and internal memos must be approved via this form.5. Enter details for clarity to ensure that there is no ambiguity in applicable#ftes
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@m’f{ 4. All rates including those (ﬁat r*:cd




——- Forwarded Message -—

From: "rahul g" <rahul.g@modiproperties.com>

To: "shravya.s ." <shravya.s@modiproperties.com>

Sent: Fri, Jan 21, 2022 at 12:23 PM

Subject: Fw: Reagrding approval for concrete pouring purpose

Regards,
G.Rahul
KNM

— Forwarded Message —-

From: "rahul g" <rahul.g@modiproperties.com>

To: "maheshramulu@modiproperties.com” <maheshramulu@modiproperties.com>
Sent: Sat, Dec 18, 2021 at 12:34 PM

Subject: Fw: Reagrding approval for concrete pouring purpose

Regards,
G.Rahul
KNM

— Forwarded Message —

From: "rahul g" <rahul.g@modiproperties.com>

To:

Sent: Sat, Dec 18, 2021 at 12:16 PM

Subject: Fw: Reagrding approval for concrete pouring purpose

Regards,
G.Rahul
KNM

-—- Forwarded Message —

From: "Soham Modi" <sohammodi@modiproperties.com>

To: "Anand B Bhargavi" <anandhomeline@gmail.com>

Cc: "Rahul G - Asst. Engineer - KNM" <rahul.g@modiproperties.com>, "Balamurali Krishna C
Project Manager" <balamuralikrishna.c@modiproperties.com>

Sent: Sat, Dec 18, 2021 at 10:31 AM

Subject: Re: Reagrding approval for concrete pouring purpose

Ok

Regards,
Soham Modi

From: anandhomeline@gmail.com

Sent: 18 December 2021 9:32 am

To: sohammodi@modiproperties.com

Cc: rahul.g@modiproperties.com; balamuralikrishna.c@modiproperties.com
Subject: Re: Reagrding approval for concrete pouring purpose

| only finalized the rate and told to Rahul. | am paying same at GVDC. Same rate | finalized
for NRK also.
Pay to labour as per Rs.800/- per cu.mir

Regards.

On Sat, 18 Dec, 2021, 8:46 am , <sochammodi@modiproperties.com> wrote:

Anand,




Look into this.

Regards,

Soham Modi

From: rahul g <rahul.g@modiproperties.com>

Sent: 17 December 2021 20:34

To: Soham Modi <schammodi@modiproperties.com>

Cc: Anand Kumar Bhashyakaria <anandhomeline@gmail.com>; balamuralikrishna.c .
<balamuralikrishna.c@modiproperties.com>

Subject: Reagrding approval for concrete pouring purpose

Dear soham sir,

As per anand instructions, we are giving 800/- per cum for concrete pouring purpose with
labour to prasad( civil contractor) for columns work.

Please give us approval.

Regards,
G.Rahul
Nrk



