
GOVERNMENT OF TELANGANA 
           ABSTRACT 

The Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation Act, 2014 – The A.P. Agricultural Land (Conversion for 
Non Agricultural purposes) Act, 2006 (Act.No.3 of 2006) – Adaptation to the State of 
Telangana–Orders – Issued. 

 
REVENUE (LAND MATTERS) DEPARTMENT 

 
G.O. Ms. No.4                                       Dated: 05-01-2016. 
 
Read: 
 
 The Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation Act, 2014 (Central Act No. 6 of 2014)  
 
O R D E R:- 
 
  Whereas, Section 101 of the Andhra Pradesh Re-organisation Act, 2014 (Central 
Act No. 6 of 2014), the appropriate Government i.e., the State of Telangana is empowered by 
order, to make such adaptations and modifications of any law ( as defined in section 2 (f) of the 
Act)   made  before 02-06-2014, whether by way of repeal or amendment as may be necessary or 
expedient, for the purpose of facilitating the application of such law in the State of Telangana 
before  expiration of two years from             02-06-2014; and thereupon every  such law shall 
have effect subject to the adaptations and modifications so made until altered, repealed or 
amended by a competent Legislature or other  competent authority.  
 
2.  And whereas, it has become necessary to adapt and modify the A.P. Agricultural 
Land (Conversion for Non Agricultural purposes) Act, 2006 (Act No.3 of 2006) for the purpose 
of facilitating its application in relation to the State of Telangana. And whereas, after careful 
examination, Government have decided to adapt and modify the said Act which are in force as on 
01.06.2014. 
 

3.  Accordingly, the following Notification will be published in an Extra Ordinary Issue 
of the Telangana Gazette, dated: 05.01.2016. 

 
NOTIFICATION 

 
  In exercise of the powers conferred by section 101 of the Andhra Pradesh Re-
organisation Act, 2014 (Central Act No. 6 of 2014), the Government of Telangana hereby makes 
the following Order, namely: 
 
I. (1) This Order may be called the Andhra Pradesh Agricultural Land     (Conversion 
for Non-Agricultural Purposes) Act, 2006 (Telangana Adaptation Order) 2016; 
            (2) It shall come into force with immediate effect.  
 
II.    The Andhra Pradesh General Clauses Act, 1891 shall apply for the interpretation of 
this Order as it applies for the interpretation of a State Act.  
 
III.  For the purpose of this Order, and the Act adapted herein, the expression “the State” 
shall have the meaning and area as specified in Section 3 of the Andhra Pradesh Reorganisation 
Act, 2014. 
 
IV.  In the Andhra Pradesh Agricultural Land (Conversion for Non-Agricultural 
Purposes) Act, 2006 (A.P. Act No. 3 of 2006). 

P.T.O 



-2- 
 

(1) Throughout the Act for the words Andhra Pradesh” (occurring otherwise than in a 
citation or description or title of other enactments), the word  “Telangana”  shall be 
substituted. 
 (2) In Section 3  

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words and expression  “within 30 days”  the words and 
expression “within 7 days”  shall be substituted.  
 (ii) in sub-section (4), for the words “within fifteen days”  the words  and expression 
“within one week”  shall be substituted. 
(iii) in sub-section (5), for the words and expression “within 30 days”  the words  and 
expression “within 7 days”  shall be substituted. 
(iv) in sub-section (6)  

(a) for the words “within sixty days”  the words “within fifteen days”  shall be 
substituted; 
 (b) for the words “within thirty days”  the words and expression “within 7 
days” shall be substituted.  

 (3)  In Section 4  

(a) In sub-section (1), for the figures “9%”, the figures   “3%” shall be substituted; 
(b)  In the proviso under sub-section (1), for the figures “5%”, the figures “2%” shall be  

 substituted and the words “Greater Visakhapatnam Municipal Corporation and  
 Vijayawada Municipal Corporation” shall be deleted. 

 
                      (BY ORDER AND IN THE NAME OF THE GOVERNOR OF TELANGANA) 

 

                                                                     B.R.MEENA, 
     PRINCIPAL SECRETARY TO GOVERNMENT 

To 
The Commissioner, Printing, Stationary and Stores, Chanchalguda, 
Hyderabad. (With a request to supply 100 copies of the notification) 
The Chief Commissioner of Land Administration, Telangana State, Hyderabad.  
All the District Collectors through CCLA., TS., Hyderabad.  
All the Departments of Secretariat.  
All the Sections of Revenue Department.  
Copy to: 
The Law (C) Department. 
SF/SC.  
                              // FORWARDED:: BY ORDER // 
 
   
               

                                                                    SECTION OFFICER 


