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aruna@modiproperties.com

From: “Soham Modi" <sohammodi@modiproperties.com>
Date: 29-03-20199:12 AM
To: "aruna" <aruna@modiproperties.com:>

Subject:  Fw: Non payment to Sri Dattatreya Enterprises

Print

Regards,
Soham Modi

From: ksri707@gmail.com

Sent: 27 March 2019 7:25 pm

To: aruna@maodiproperties.com

Cc: sohammodi@modiproperties.com

Subject: Re: Non payment to Sri Dattatreya Enterprises

Dear Sir,

I agree that I need to pay him 14 lakhs outstanding from my company, as my previous mails to you I
always tried to mention about not getting payments for labour ,] am ready for any aduit on my
account ] promise you that not even a single rupee is diverzed to any place, since last three weeks I
started getting my labour payments from all the sites and I am thankful to you for giving me a lot of
support, now I have no pressure either from labour or from materials payment, I am ready for any
action taken by you against me but request you to give a chance I need 3-4 weeks to come out of
everything, I have appointed an engineer at cheerrallapalli site work is going on as per my schedule,
we have already started plastering 81 Vila, I have set my people a target to hand over the villas by
April end or Max by may 1 week.

Please treat this as my last mistake, I promise you as long as I am working under you I will make
sure no such things would again be repeated.

Thanks&regards
K Srinivas
KSR Builders.

On Wed, Mar 27, 2019, 17:47 <aruna@modiproperties.com> wrote:
Sreenivas,

I have received a complaint from Sri Dattatreya Enterprises about non-payment of bills, Please
explain.

Regards,
Soham Modi

29-03-2019



