Stham Modi

From: anand kumar bhashyakarla <anandhomeline@gmail.com>

Sent: \Q 28b62017 1324

To: Qc

Cc: X\&V soham modi; radheshyam; ramakrishna@modiproperties.com;
: nilgiriestate@modiproperties.com

Subject: Re: Curing photos not sent at NE-}| Site. reg-

Good afterrnoon .

Already we have taken the photos in your camera . We dint know they have uploaded are not . Uploading is not part
of our scope. If you insist from now on wards we will upload the photos on whats app .

L

we are keep on asking the Ramakrishna |, he is telling the same thing that internet and systems art:}l}g/pnoue@.
Regards. \VAV/

C‘:Ana nd. ' QJJ/ 50‘/‘1 aw.:i\’

\
On 28 Jyne 2017 at 00:22, OQC <gc@modiproperties.com> wrote: 5L d_\a VJK
I To, /Lu)l e
MD §ir, | Qv ¢

”—f
As per Internal memo-912/89/a. C@*w . Gﬂ /

1) Villa no-99 Slab-02, Curing Photos hot sent till this date  ——
a) 7 days X Rs.5000 /- = Rs.35,000 /- (Contractor) (L

b) 7 days X Rs.1000 /- = Rs.7000 /<{Project Manager) Q V)
_ NO _
2) Villa no-97 slab-01, Curing photos not Sent fill this date. 11 l G Y"y
a) 9 days X Rs.5000 /- = Rs.45,000 /- (Contractor) (,.Jﬂ)

b) 9 days X Rs.1000 /- = Rs. 9,000 /- ( Project Manager ) \VV
. 9] 6 b/

. 3) Villa no-101 slab-01, Curing photos not Sent till this date.

(]|

a} 9 days.X Rs.5000 /-
b) 9 days X Rs.1000 /-

o

X
Rs.45,000 /- (Contractor) )0\ JA\
Rs. 8,000 /- ( Project Manager)

The Total Amount to be Fined on Contractor Rs.1,25,000 /- and on Project Manager Rs.25,000 /- .

' NOTE:- Sir, We are Regularly making follow ups with the Concern En

. above issue, So they are simply saying that Internet not working and
Site,

gineer and Project Manager regarding
at some times Systems not working at

This is for Your kind Infromation.

Thanking You.

Regards,
QC Team




)

.

g s

ANAND KUMAR BHASHYAKARLA

M/S. HOME-LINE INFRA,
301,Nagarjuna Arcade, Sree Colony,

Neredmet X Road, Secunderabad.-500056.

Mobile: 9246548074




