Soham Modi

From: Lavanya <Iavanya@n€dipr perties.com>

Sent: 08 04 2017 14:44 e i

To: accounts@modiproperties.com

Cc: nilgiriestate@modiproperties.com; sohammodi@modiproperties.com
Subject: RE: Stephen Petty Cash Reversal

To,

Sambasiva Rao Sir,

Rs.10,000/- Cash paid to J.Rambabu on behalf of Stephen Medical expenses purpose dated on 20.12.2016 . still we
are not received the accounts

Pls do the needful.
Regards,

). Lavanya
Accountant | +91 74161 03165 | lavanya@modiproperties.com
Modi Properties Pvt. Ltd. | www.modiproperties.com
5-4-187/ 3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad -03 | Ph: +91 40 6633 5551
Don’t just buy a flat or villa! Buy a great lifestyle!
We build affordable flats & villas in gated communities

From: Lavanya [mailto:lavanya@modiproperties.com]
Sent: 28-03-2017 3:25 PM

To: 'accounts@modiproperties.com'

Cc: 'nilgiriestate@maodiproperties.com'

Subject: Stephen Petty Cash Reversal

Dear Sir,

-
Rs.10,000/- Cash paid to J.Rambabu on behalf of Stephen Medical expenses purpose dated on 20.12.2016 . still
we are not received the accounts

Pls do the needful.
Regards,

D. Lavanya

Accountant | +91 74161 03165 | lavanya@modiproperties.com

Modi Properties Pvt. Ltd. | www.modiproperties.com

5-4-187/ 3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad -03 | Ph: +91 40 6633 5551
Don’t just buy a flat or villa! Buy a great lifestyle!

We build affordable flats & villas in gated communities




