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o Tetmsese — |
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Authorizéd By

) . i . - \h - \ﬁ' \ )
Material to be_s’mﬁed _ : AN A ‘:‘A A=t e
Shift from

Shift to

Vehicle Type {1 Tractor o-es O Blade Tractor

[0 Other ——
TAGR LR m

Hire charges register serial no. ) wo



¢ -
Hire Charges Voucher
Company Name : Nilgiri Estates
Project Name :  Nilgiri Estate

m:bu_wma Name: G.Sneha Latha

i
| HCNo | HC Date
80787 | 21404 | 06-07-2020 JcB
S TS07GP8807 Units : umq :oc_.
,ﬂ.oi.m.&w .U:ﬂ m:_m_nm
80788 | 21405 | 06-07-2020 JCB
B " s07GPeso7 Units : perhour
Towards Dust Shifting’ _
80789 | 21408 | 06-07-2020 Tractor with tipper without labour (per day)
............ B F_u,m._c.mm..mu . Units ; per day (9.3
._dim&w._u:w._.m:_n_:m e
80790 | 21407 _mom-ow_momo #mg_&s_sﬁ_uEE_sos__%oEemams
_ A U APZ4AR4TES Uniits : per day ©3
Towards Dust m:_m_:.m ...........

0

Dto 6 P.M

Certjfied by:

“APPROVED B

eS|

| \JUL 2000

.m:.mawn

RA ASH
,. « AERaght counts |

AsST. n:;:;.mmq
NILGIR! E E._,% ES

Project Manager
Nilgifirgiedetbager

>ono==$ anager

Rate :

Rate :

Rate :

10-07-2020 12:18:22

09:21

14:02

88 17 41
00:21 | 17:41 |

Pages: 33
6845
2.07-2020
"1 08-07-2020

, ‘,‘<‘9_.n_:m_« _zo :

[JW | 2400.00

[ Jw | 2400.00

1800 | Jw | 1800.00

/

1 W | 1800.00

Managing Director




Hire Charges Voucher

no:._vm:< Zmam Nilgiri Estates
Nilgiri Estate
G.Sneha Latha

Project Name :
Supplier Name :

 Hire Charges - Job Work Payment
Towards Tractor and JCB shifting work

| Bther Additions -

Other Deductions :

Rupees : Eight Thousand Two Hundred Seventy Four Only.

10-07-2020 12:18:22
Advice for Payment
Voucher No
P ARTIGUL ARG ™ 7 s
............ Amount Payable : 8400.00
et e e e et e Amount Pagable s st

.. .Wﬂm._..x_ o.co., .

- v
il
ED B “m@
VERIFI P
10 UL 202

M. MAHESH KUMAR
MANAGER-AUDIT

Certified by:

g

v-o_mnvgm
Nilgiri AR ger

N. Bha
Asst. &
NILGIR

Ao e o A

Ceitifind by

ok

m<.

>no\®_sn=nmoq

0.00

Gross
.Bm.x. 1.50 ~ TDS Amount
0.00 $GST% 1000 | 0.00 Total GST Amount

Managing Director

8400.00

Pages:2of2

8400.00

0.00 |

126.00 N
0.00

8274.00




Yahoo Mail - Fw: Required approval for JCB and Tmctors/ o https:/imail yahoo.com/d/folders/1 - ~ssages/I 130?.inﬂ=1'n&.lang=en-m&.partuer=none&.src=fp

o e

Fw: Required approval for JCB and Tractors

From: anil m (anil.m@modiproperties.com)
To . bhargavi@modiproperties.com
Date: Wednesday, July 8, 2020, 9:54 AM GMT+5:30

Regards,

M. Anil Yaday

Engineer [ +91 9030005002, 86858981590 | anil.m@modiproperties.com
Modi Properties Pyt Ltd. | www.modiproperties.com

5_4_187/3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad _o3

Don't Just buy a ftat or villat buy a great life stylel

we build affordable flats & villas in gated communities,

——- Forwarded message —

From: "Soham Modi* <sohammodi@modipropeqties.com:-
To: "AniL.M Construction® <anil.m@modipropertics.coms>
Ce:

Sent: Tue, 7 Jul 2020 at 18:15
Subject: Re: Required approval for JGB and Tractors
Approved

Repards,
Scham Modi.

From: anil. n@modiproperties.com

Sent: July 7, 2020 4:40 PM

To: sohammodi@modiproperties.com

Reply-to: anll.m@rnodiproperties.com

Cc: vilay@modiproperties.com

Subject: Required approval for JCB and Tractors

Respected Soham Sir,

At NE, for excavation of Road beside Villa No 183 for road laying we require JCB and 2 tractors for 4 day to work tomorrow. Please give approval for Hire
charges extra this week for 1 day other than weeidy payment of Rs 35,000/-,

Regards,

M. Anil Yaday

Engineer | +91 9030005002, 8688981990 |anil.m_@modip_[9£e;fies.oo_m
Modi Properties Put Ltd. | www.modiproperties.com
$_4_187/3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad _03

Don't Just buy a flat or villal huy a great life stylel

we build affordable flats & villas in gated communities.

\,>{

Voo
1of1 I . 08-07-2020,12:11
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B
! N'inli:'jxw Eelates
P 5 Nilgiri Estate
HC Date " "VehNo = Start Time  'EndTime PayType 21404
¢ 06-07-2020 TSO7GP8807 @ 09:21 o 12:58 Jw

et

HC 80787

Units " MnRa MR oy Rae
' 800.00 - 80000 . 3 - g0 |

per hour 2400.00

‘Supplier |

“Towards Bust Shiffing T

Rupess  Two Thousand Four Hundred Only. T

Certified by:

e

>

Project Manager
Nilgiri Estates

H KUMAR

MHES \
MQA*:‘\&;-_C.E RAUDT




Mataria| Shifting Authorization Form

NS

O O\Q)'M; 09 Cﬁ

No.A grmg )
Date - Ch -7 ~20D | Time
| Authorizeg By CAA«Q\ Engg. Sign %
Materia to be shifteq | E‘*@ o ,\\Qﬁj\v_\ .
Shift from
Shift to o
Vehicle Type '

[ Tractor (JacE I:I Blade Tractor [J Other :
Vehicle No. (—]\SO:}Gl P(&%ﬂ Vehicle Owner ’ Gjl“ 8: I l : “ a

Hire charges register serial no.

Security / Supervisor Sign

(/"‘@/ Start Time OCth Q\ Stop Time

&2 53



£

"mmﬁﬁgw/Eéﬁﬁéém“ e

L Nilgiri Estate
Date _ VehNo ™ " StaitTime ~ |Ed Time

. per hour
“Supplier Name
. G.Snehalatha

WorkDescnptlon

.~ Towards Dust Shifting ™~

RUbéé"s”':'Tﬁé"ThBﬁééﬁd"r’-"&:'r'Hijﬁa'réd"bhlyl""'"'" o

HC 80788

. 21405

732

3 800 2400.00

Printed On 07-07-2020 15:31:16

I e .
f H - T e e et

Certified by:

y

Project Manager

L. INWARD
frerd No: Qyp s YRy
i Dt ‘
Signe—-s i

™ !

/

NILGIR

Nilgiri Estates

g ——————

v Nilgiri

i

Y, {ED BY

JUL 2070

H KUMAR

M, MARESE &0

MANAGE
R daahiasas

\,

i
f




7
T T T —
. Nilgiri Estate
‘HCDate ™ VehNo Stant Time -EndTime " PayType
. 05072020 AP21UBS22 0840 - 1741 aw
Tractor with tipper without labour {per day).

perday(930 180000 180000 1 1s00 | 000
G.Sneha Latha

‘Work Description *-
Towards Dust Shiffing ™

Rupees | Orie Thousand Eight Hundred Only.

Printed On 07-07-2020 15:31:16

Csrtified by: 3 Cerlir..

Project Manager A:lsta?

__ Niigiri Estates NILGIR: .

> __-“'-“.'

T e DA e ]

" “:"::"-":‘:JJ;

VERIFIED BY /
10 JuL 712

M. MAHESH K{/MAR
MANAGE R-AUDIT

’/‘K'\‘
i ]
ot
\
]




s 0919 — oo
] Material Shifting Authorization Form

No. A

. | 4776
o —po T T

[J Jee D Blade Tractor 7 Other

OR - Yp | Stop Time {CL 4|




P
" Nilgt Estates
L, Nilgiri Estate
- 08-07-2020 © AP24AA4763 . 0921 1741 | Jw j
Erﬂdﬁ'iﬁfi‘féni' B e e ‘
- Trator with tipper without labour (per day) ™

HC 80790

U Rl i g B —
Perday(9.30.  1800.00 . 180000 1 1800 | 1800.00

G.Sneha Latha
EWork Bescription -
Towards Dust Shiftng 77

_Rupeé§ : One Thousand Eight Hundred Only. "

Printed On 07-07-2020 15:31:16

. INWARD it

1:;\ ward Nox 3\\\{&\ ot: § q- 96 a
% 312N No: Dt

‘ _ _.Received By: Sign: =
Project iﬁanegef NILG! . @n&
Nilgiri Estates === Nilgiri Estater

N 4 Tl it R,

Ceriified by:

g

S e

1
"RIFIED BY 7
VE »

10 JuL 20

HESH KUMAR
M RGER-AUDIT

TN TN
- et

R LI T L TR TR § LTI KL N o O P TS A Tt 80 3£ -+



oqaY - 1008

Material Shifting Authorization Form

No. A 4777 )

Date DE-pF ~2020 | Time |

Autﬁorizéd By CA‘Q A Engg. Sign | ,é—‘\—q

Material to be shifted Ty ﬂ]fm 3.,

Shift from

Shift to

Vehicle Type %cto} [0 yce [0 Biade Tractor [ ] Other

Vehi No. ALguhh ks [ Yoo ome | (3 Qnphalata

Hire charges register serial no. a\}{ Oﬂc

Security / Supervisor Sign @3/’ Start Time Oct ' Q) Stop Time | 1%} Y}

-




; l\.,/ Nilgiri Estates .
M G Road, Ranigunj -
Secunderabad .
State Name : , Code :

Payment Voucher

No. PAY{30243) 1Q 2% Dated

Particulars

Amount

Account :
DW-G.Snehalatha

TDS-1.5% Contract

Through :
BANK-YES BANK LTD A/G No:-009763700002042
On Account of :

Being online neft to G.Snehalatha towards Tractor and JCB Shifting work as péf
v.n0.6822 details enclosed.

Amount {in words) :
Indian Rupees Thirty Four Thousand Nine Hundred Sixty Seven Only

35,500.00
{-)533.00

Py
7

¥ 34,967.00

b Y=

Prepared by: mnm@modiproperties.com Approved by Receiver's Signature



. Hire Charges Voucher _".,\ J

Company Name : Nilgiri Estates

Rate :

Rate :

~ Rate:

Rate .

) Project Name :  Nilgiri Estate
Supplier Name : G.Sneha Latha
...... HCNe | HC Date Equipment Name \ vm:_nz_w_.m
80316 wam W..m.m..o.m..m.omo ‘Tractor with a.c.cmﬂ E_Eo:.ﬁ. fabour ( Aum_. ams ......... .
’ - AP21UB822 Units : ‘per day G.mo.n.o.m PM
Towards Debries removing from site to out side =~
| 80346 | .Ewum o .n.m.a.mpwam.a.. Tractor with ipper without labour (perdayy
Rt S S - psUsRss Unls™ pordsy BAOBEBM ~
To Wards Debris Removing From Site
80347 | 21379 | 26-06-2020 Tractor with tipper without labour (per day)
A, L APAARATEZ  Units: perday (9.30106PM
: ._..o.Emam. .U.m.a:m meoS:Q FromSite =~ 77
80348 | 21380 JoB T e e
R S . easaEusgeE T Ui ._uo._.. four
To Wards Labour oc.m.:..o._.w _»maossu .
80349 | 21381 | 26-06-2020 UCB
To Wards Labour Quarters Removing
© 80404 m._m.mm 'Y27.06-2020 Tractor with tipper without iabour (per dayy
e e e iegaE T URS s e diy (09066 B
Towards Debries removing from site to out side
80405 | 21383 | 27-06-2020 Tractor with tipper without iabour (per day)
_ | m AP24AA4762 Unifs | per day (9.30 to 6 P.M
W Towards Debries 33%.5@.:63 site .
180406 | 21384 | 27-06-2020 JCB
o o . TSO8EV2096 Units : per hour
4 owards Debries removing from site {o out side
80407 - 21385 | _N_w._om.momo B o
TSO8EV2096 Units : per hour
Certified by: Certified by:
Pro) mmww% mmﬂ >mmﬂ Enginagr Accolnts z_m:muoq
L z_mm:_ sta NILGIR! £5° .ﬁ.,,‘,-rw L . JAY

Rate :

1800

800

800

1800

1800

S.Time |

09:22
09:14
10:15

09:26

14:05

09:15

09:15

03-07-2020 15:05:06

! Voucher No

E g

17:47

18:17

18:17

13:03

1816

17:57

1757

P31

1757

1 1800

800

1 | 1800

'3 | 800

3 | 800

_um%m ._ of 3

W

Caw

Managing Director

LW | 2400.00

Gross

_ 1800. 8

1800.00

1800.00

1800.00

2400.00




- Hire Charges Voucher

| 21388

80485 | 21391

80487 | 21302

21303

2]
[=2
(%33
o
LN

21394

21395

80504 | 21396

28-06-2020

_,..,&._%._w%a

‘ wwqu.&ouo

01-07-2020

01072020

CTS08EV2098

o._ oq.womo

01-07-2020

e g BSG  Uiits + e day (0.30 16 6 AM |

28-06-2020

CAP21U6822  Units: perday (9.30to 6P.M

( u o 03-07-2020 15:05:06 Pages:2of3

Towards _uoc_._mm _maosac from site to out mam

©1800.00

[=4
©o
w
-
—
-
n

[
iy

W | 1800.00

Rate: 1800

~ Rate: 800

Rate: 800

W | 3200.00

Units : per hour™

Towards Excavation for road work in fotiot

q.meo_.E_gabUm_.E_Eocn_mco:_.:umﬂams e T 7T

Towards Debries removing from site to out wam,_ .
1w | 1800.00

09:28 | 17:58 | 1 | 1800

Tractor with ﬂ_uumq s_soE labour Gm_, ams

Towards Debries removing

Certified by:

Project
Milgiri Estates

fidhager

Asst Managing Director

NILGim

Accoun

anager

e




Hire Charges Voucher () o) | 03-07-2020 15:05:06 Pages:3 of 3

Advice for Payment

Company Narme : Nilgiri Estates
Project Name :  WNilgiri Estate
Supplier Name :  G.Sneha Latha Voucher No : 6822

_u>mjoc_.>xm _ Amount

Hire Charges - Job Work Payment R . AmountPayable:- 3550000

d d JCB Shifti
Towards Tractor and JCB Shifting Work 35500.00

" Hire Charges - On A/C Payment Amount Payable :-

0.00

Gross 35500.00

oo [ 000 ] :_8:,3, - ow

CGST% (000 | 000 | SGST%

Other Deductions :
0.00
| 3496760

8 Total

pa

Certified by: Certified by:
Project Man
Z;m:.mwmvw mmﬁ.mu

N. Bhakgbvi
Asst, ﬂ:\u_}amw
NILGIR] &

,,...._m-...-.n-- -

Accou anager Managing Director




Yahoo Mail.- Fw: Required Approval For Tractors And Dept; “ur's On Sunday 28/06/2020 https:/fmail yehoo com/d/folders/l/  “ages/10627guce referrer=aHROCHMSLyOt Y WisLah...

Fw: Required Approval For Tractors And Dept Labour's On Sunday 28/06/2020

From: Vijay Raj (vijay@modiproperties.com)
To:  bhargavi@modiproperties.com
Date: Friday, July 3, 2020, 3:31 PM GMT+5:30

— Forwarded Message —

From: Soham Modi <schammodi@modiproperties.com=

To: Anil.M Construction <anil. m@modiproperties.com>

Ce: Vijay Raj G. Construction <vijay@modiproperties.com>

Sent: Sunday, June 28, 2020, 04:16:21 PM GMT+5:30

Subject Re: Required Approval For Tractors And Dept Labour's On Sunday 28/06/2020

Approved

Regards,
Soham Modi

From: anil.m@modipropertles.com

Sent: 27 June 2020 3:01 pm

To: schammodi@modiproperties.com

Reply to: anil. n@modipropetties.com

Cc: vijay@modiproperties.com

Subject: Required Approval For Tractors And Dept Labour's On Sunday 28/06/2020

Respected MD Sir,

Wa Required 2no's Of Tractors And 2Pairs Of Depariment Labour's For Shifting Tiles From V. no's 183,185 to V. no 148 Store room ,So We Required Your
Approval To Work Tractors and Dept Worker's On Sunday i.e 28/06/2020

Regards,

M. Anil Yaday

Engineer | +91 9030005002, 868898199¢ | anil. m@mediproperties.com
Madi Properties Pvi. Ltd. | www.modiproperties.com

5_4_187/ 3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad _ 03

Don't Just buy a flat or villal buy a great life style!

we build affordable flats & villas in gated communitics.

o

lofl 03-07-2020, 15:36




Yahoo Mail - Fw: Approval for JCB and Tractors P

10of1

.

Fw: Approval for JCB and Tractors
From: Vijay Raj (vijay@modiproperties.com}

To:  bhargavi@modiproperties.com
Date: Friday, July 3, 2020, 3:27 PM GMT+5:30

=== Forwarded Message -——

From: "schammodi@modiproperties.com® <sohammaodi@modiproperties.com>

To: Vijay Raj <vijay@modiproperties.com>
Sent: Monday, June 29, 2020, 07:20:00 PM GMT+5:30
Subject: RE: Approval for JCB and Tractors

approved

Regards,

Soham Modi

hitps://mail.yahoo.com/d/folders/1ir 3gésli06l?guoe_.referrer‘—a!-lROCIMELy%YWlsLnlh...

-

From: Vijay Raj <vijay@modiproperties.com>

Sent: 29 June 2020 16:26

To: Soham Modi <sohammodi@modiproperties.com>
Ce: Ne-const . <ne-const@modiproperties.com>
Subject: Approval for JCB and Tractors

Dear Soham Sir,

At NE, for excavation of Road beside Villa No 183 for road laying we require JCB and 2 tractors for 2 da
charges extra this week for 2 days other than weekly payment of Rs 35,000/

Regards,
G. Vijay Raj

Asst. Project Manager | +91 98494 97484 | vijay@modiproperties.com

Modi Properties Pvt. Ltd. | www.modiproperties.com

5-4-187/ 3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad - 03 | +91 40 66335551 f

Don't just buy a flat or villal Buy a great lifestylel

We build affordable flats & villas in gated communities.

Yy

ys to work from tomomow. Please give approval for Hire

03-07-2020, 15:36




Yahoo Mail - Fw: Required approval for JCB And Tractor T

. i 2 —
N

https://mail.yahoo com/d/folders/limc 25/938.intl=in. lang=en-IN& partner=noned.sco=fp

' Fw:Required approval for JCB And Tractor

From: anilm (anilm@modiproperties.com)
Tor  bhargavi@modiproperties.com
Date: Thursday, June 25, 2020, 11:57 AM GMT+5:30

Regards,

M. Anil Yaday

Engineer | +91 9030005002, 8658981990 | anil.m@modiproperties.com
Meodi Properties Pvt. Lid. | www.modiproperties.com

5_4_187/ 3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad .03

Don't Just buy a flat or villal buy a great life styie!

we build affordable flats & villas in gated communities,

~— Forwarded message —

From: "Scham Mod" <sohammodi@modiproperties.com>
To: "Anil.M Construction” <anit. m@modiproperties.com>

Cc: "Vijay Raj G. Construction® <vijay@modiproperties.com>
Sent: Thu, 25 Jun 2020 at 11:30

Subject: Re: Required approval for JCB And Tractor
Approved

Regards,
Soham Modi.

From: anil.m@modiproperties.com

Sent: June 24, 2020 5:23 PM

To: schammuodi@modiproperties.com
Reply-to: anil. n@modiproperties.com

Cc: vijlay@modiproperties.com

Subject: Required approval for JCB And Tractor

Respected Soham Sir,

AUNE, for Removing Labour's Quarters And Common Area's Levelling we require JCB and 2 tractors for 2

days to work from tomorrow. Please give approval
for Hire charges extra thie week for 2 days other than weekiy. payment of Rs 35,000/,

Regardgs,

M. Anil Yaday

Engineer | +91 8030005002, 8588981990 | anil. n@modipioperties.com
Modi Properties Pvt. Ltd, [ www. modioroperties,corn

5_4_187/3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad _03

Don't Just buy a flat or villa! buy a great life style!

we build affordable flats & villas in gated communities,

>

tof 1 25-06-2020, 12:50




Nilgiri Estates

M G Road, Ranigunj ~
Secunderabad :
State Name ; Telangana, Code : 36
Payment Voucher
- No. : PAY, 123;@ lg Rag Dated : 17-Jul-2020
Particulars ~_Amount
Account :
SUP-Global Safety Solutions 798.00
Through :
BANK-YES BANK LTD AIC No-009763700002042
Cn Account of :
Online paid towards credit balance against bills
Amount (in words) :
Indian Rupees Seven Hundred Ninety Eight Only
¥798.00

Prepared by: lavanya

Receiver's Signature




Nilgiri Estates o
U M G Road, Ranigunj e
Secunderabad
State Name : Telangana, Code : 35

Payment Voucher

No. : PA@@ gy -, ...

Dated - 17-Jul-2020
Partibulars . Amount
Account :

SUP-Ganesh Tube Traders { 1,443.00
New Ref 2g 1,443.00 Dr

|
Through ; :

BANK-YES BANKLTD AC No:-009763700002042
On Account of :

Online paid towards credit balance against bills
Amount (in words) :

Indian Rupees One Thousand Four Hundred Fo Eight On|
___in _._Pw____._ 1ared Forty Eight nly ———
-_

—_—

Prepared by: lavanya

Approved by

Receiver's Signature




Nilgiri Estates
L M G Roaq, Ranigunj
Secunderabad
State Name - Telangana, Coge - 36

R

Payment Voucher
. A e . X
No. : PAYHO33R) } 0 = § Dated : 17-yul-2020
__Particulars

Amount
—_HH_____—“_E_E‘_M i3
Account :

SUP-Prafy) Sanitary

39,176.00
- New Ref PAYM0336 39,176.00 Dr

Through :

BANKCYES BANK LTD AYC No-008763700000042
Cn Account of :

Online paid towards credi
Amount (in words) :

indian Rupees Thirty Nine Thousand One Hundred Seve'ng Six On}
' R _ ‘ ¥ 39,176.00

Prepared by: lavanya

t balance against bills

Approved by Receivers Signature




Nilgiri Estates
M G Road, Ranigunj

Secunderabad
SUP-Praful Sanitary
Monthly Summary
1-Apr-2020 to 18-Jul-2020
Page 1

Particulars Transactions Closing

Debit l Credit Balance
Opening Bafance
April
May : 2,477.00 2477.00Cr
June 3,928.00 1.852.00 401.00 Cr
July 68,303.00 67,902.00
Grand Total

72,231.00 72,231.00




H

i

o Nilgiri Estates
/ MG Road, Ranigunj
- Secunderabad

State Name : Telangana, Code : 36

Payment Voucher

No. : PAYH0332 {0 L g

Sy

Dated : 17-Jul-2020

Particulars -

Actount : o

SUP-Summit Sales LLP

Through :
BANK-YES BANK LYD A/C No-008763700002042
On Account of :

Online paid to Summitsales LLP towards credit balance against bills
Amouwin words) : ‘

Indian Rup®®s Four Lakh Only

- Amount

4,00,000.00

¥ 4,00,000.00

Prepared by: lavanya Approved by

Receiver's Signature




L/

Summit Sales LLP (20-21)

M G Road, Ranigunj
Secunderabad

Material Suppliers-Companies

-

Group Summary
1-Apr-2020 to 17-Jul-2020

Particulars

Closing Balance

Page 1
]

Debit [

Credit

MSUP-Aedis Developers LLP

MSUP-B & C Estates

MSUP-Bloomdale Owners Association
MSUP-East Side Residency Annojiguda LLp
MSUP-Greenwood Estates

MSUP-GV Researetr Center Pvt Ltd
MSUP-Kadakia & Modi Housing
MSUP-Matrix Recon Private Limited
MSUP-Mayflower Grand Owners Association
MSUP-MC Modi Educatioal Trust
MSUP-Mehta & Modi Reality Kowkur LLP
MSUP-Modi and Modi Constructions
MSUP-Modi Buitders & Infrastructures Pvt. Ltd.
MSUP-Modi Builders Methodist Complex
MSUP-Modi Farm House Hyderabad L.LP
MSUP-Modi & Modi Constructions
MSUP-Modi Properties Pvt Ltd

MSUP-Modi Properties Pvt Ltd - Platinum
MSUP-Modi Realty Genome Valley LLp
MSUP-ModrRealty Mallapur LLP
MSUP-Modi Realty Miryalguda LLp
MSUP-Narsing Raoc Mylaram

MSUP-Nidhi Modi

MSUP-Nilgiri Estates
MSUP-P8ramount,gvenue Owners Associations
MSUP-Paramount Builders
MSUP-Paramount Estates

MSUP-Rajesh Kumar J.Kadakia

‘MSUP-RM Mansion

MSUP-Satyavani Homes JV
MSUP-8erene Constructions LLP
MSUP-Sharad Kumar J.Kadakia
MSUP-Silver Qak Villas LLP
MSUP-Soham Modi Huf

MSLIP-Syed Mehdi and Razia Banu
MSUP-Villa Orchids LLP

MSUP-Vilta Orchids Owners Association
MSUP-Vista Homes
MSUP-Vista.Homes Owners Association

5,39,963.00

39,312.60
35,001.76

68,581.03
4,22,885.04
2,811.45

- 723.96
14,202.00
223.62

0.32
5,906.38

3,78,649.40
41,575.12,
88,774.96
40,35,483.75
406
4,864.00
9,86,685.12

1.24

- 8.373.00
2,075.00
36,328.38
9,12,565.51
3,847.00
28,34,082.69

7,97,757.28

5,811.70

1,65,681.12
96,828.00 "

1,88,249.50

1,99,941.32

1,23,784.00
1.00

1,23,754.00
25,805.36

0.24

23,215.76

4,120.24
4,359.00

Grand Total

6,93,200.42

N
()

1,15,28,998.49




