Page 1 of 1

aruna@modiproperties.com

N
From: "Soham Modi" <sohammodi@modiproperties.com>
Date: 25-02-2017 9:58 AM
To: <aruna@modiproperties.com>

Subject: FW: MRM LLP

Print

From: vijayabhaskar@modiproperties.com [mailto:vijayabhaskar@modiproperties.com]
Sent: 24 02 2017 22:03

To: karnamehta@modiproperties.com
Cc: sohammodi@modiproperties.com;
saidulu@modiproperties.com

Subject: MRM LLP

praveen@modiproperties.com; kirtikumar@modiproperties.com;

’

Dear Karna Sir,

For kind information JCB rates and debris 100 cft update on purchase date base is pending,
Please note if approved and updated in purchase data base we can take hire charges payment, and

building materials payment in date base with photos. To avoid manual entry by scanning hire
charges and building materials register.

Please advice
Regards,
A.Vijay Baaskar

Admin Officer | +919100461618
vijayabhaskar@modiproperties.com

Modi Properties Pvt. Litd. | www.modiproperties.com

5-4-187/3 &4, M G Road, Secunderabad - 03 | +91 40 66335551
Don't just buy a flat or villa! Buy a great lifestyle!

We build affordable flats & villas in gated communities.
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