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Bank Name : KARUR WSYA BANK LTO'

A/c No : l{71135000003039
IFSC Codo : KVBL000t47t
Branch : BoduPPal, Hyd.rtbad'
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Purchase Order
Pageb) I Of l l0 Jul-21 l:31:27 PM Origind / Orflce Copy / Purchare Dlv.Copy

From Company: G V Reserch Centers Pvt Ltd
5-4-18713&4,II nd Floor, Soham Mansion, MG Road, Secunderabad-500003
G S T No. : 36AAHCG4562D1ZP

supplie. Details

Sri balaji fly ash bricks

Survey no 43&44,Pocharam (vill),Ghatkesar(Man),R.R Dist

Doc No

SupplyType Supply

163309

GSTIN 36ADDFS1336F1ZB

8008942642

Kind Attn :

Purchase order for the Supply of following Items.

Item Name Qtv
- Building material - Cement Solid Blocks - 6 In x8
6ln-nos

15,000.00

1004 - Buildinq material - Cement Solid Blocks - 4In x8
In x16 In - nos

5,000.002

29.00

19.00

GST Amount

0.00 5.00 456.750.00

0.00 5.00 99,750.00

Doc Date 11-01-2021

Quote No Nil

Quote Date 11-01-2021

Rate D isolo

Total Order Value , . . 555.500.00

Terms and Conditions:-

Specilication , Brand

PaymentTermi

Tax

Delivery Date

oeliYery Location

Penality For 0elay

Transpodation Cost

Warranty

Advance Paid

otherTerms

Completion Date

Measument

Sccui9

Remarks

As per dehils given in he quolalim.

After Delivery & Producljon of bill

Alltarcs induded in above p*P.

NeIt Working Day.

lnnopolb

Sy ne542, Genome valley, Thu*apally, HydeBbad, Telangana

Phone. irr. Sanjay .9502288244

Nit

OrI
\ {ttw"-'\-S,,

TBmpo( cost shall bs bome by us.

r,lil

NT

We rcs€we 0E right to lelld ibrs not confomlirE b qually and specifcalionsAbove odel tcr site use purpo6€.

NA

NA

Nil

Fot A Y Rcsctch C.n,cn PYt Ltd

Authorlsed Signalory

Accepted the above Terms and Conditions

Fot Sri bal.ii ,lY ash bricks

N

ix Thousand Five Hundred: Five LakhR Fi
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( r'm - Cement Blocks +I Site & Phase

ID no.
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l-otal

6" Cement blocks ( 16"x8"x6,) 15.000.0 15,000.0
5.000. 5 000.0" Cement blocks

l'otal
to venkateshtvara tradersNote: Issue po
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8t2t2021 Yahoo Mail - Re: Material received confirmation

Re: Material received confirmation

From: Sanjay (sanjay@modiproperties.com)

To: prabhakar@modiproperties.com; gvrc@modiproperties.com

Cc soundarya@modiproperties.com

Date: Monday, Au}ust2,2021,03:54 PM GMT+5:30

Prabhakar Sir,

lnward No 2405 dt 12-01-2021 16"x8"x6" 400 Nos

Inward No 2406 dt 12-01-2021 16"x8"x6" 400 Nos

Total 800 Nos Bricks Received and balance quantity cancelled by md sir.

' 
On 30-07-2021 13:39, Prabhakar P wrote:

P Prabhakar
Sr.Manager Purchase | +9 I 9 5022 7 7 299 I p-rcbtakal?'mod iplapsrrclsom
Modi Properties P\4. Ltd. I

5 I 187,' l & 1, M G Road, Secunderabad - 03 | +91 40 66335551

Don'tjust buy a flat or villa! Buy a great lifestyle!
We build affordable flats & villas in gated communities.

Regards,

R. Sanjay Kumar
Manager - Admin - Audit | +9r 95022 88244 | san j3y@ledip-rgplrEcr-s.A!1
Modi Propenties Pvt. Ltd. I www. modip,rop-ellle:--eg0
5-4-7871 3 & 4, M G Road, Secunderabad -03 I Ph: +9L 40 6633 5557
Don't just buy a flat or vi1la! Buy a great lifestyle!
I.Je build affondable flats & vi1las in gated communities.

Sir,Dear

gards,R

1tl

Kindly send me the material received confirmation for the PO 73'774 of Sri Balaji Flyash Bricks,
blieks supplicd in thc month of January-21.


